SECTION ONE - PAVEMENT MARKINGS #2021-43

Action Safety Supply Roadsafe Traffic Systems, Inc. Oklahoma Direct Traffic Control, Rudy Construction | cuslomerservice@ sharonp@
Oklahoma City, OK City, OK o Oklahoma City, OK | potlersbeads.com eplanning.com
¥ Okahoma City, OK 4 LY —— . ——
Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Mk Plastic Bulg- Plastic MUK} Plastic i
Polymer Polymer Polymer Polymer
ESTIMATED
ITEM QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pavement Markings
A. |4" Wide Line (LF) 70,000 $0.75| $52,500.00 $0.65| $45,500.00( $0.79 $55,300.00] $0.81 $56,700.00( No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
B. |6" Wide Line (LF) 40,000 $0.78] $31,200.00 $0.68| $27,200.00| $0.88 $35,200.00] $0.89 $35,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
C. |8" Wide Line (LF) 3,000 $0.80 $2,400.00 $0.80] $2,400.00] $1.40 $4,200.00) $1.65 $4,950.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
D. |12" Wide Line (LF) 500 $0.95 $475.00 $1.00 $500.00{ $4.50 $2,250.00| $4.50 $2,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
E. |24" Wide Line (LF) 4,000 $5.00] $20,000.00] $5.00 $20,000.00| $13.00 $52,000.00] $13.00 $52,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F. |ONLY 8ft X 5.9ft (EA) 10 $40.00 $400.00 $45.00 $450.00| $350.00 $3,500.00] $275.00 $2,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Grade Crossing (RXR) 8ft X
G. |20ft (EA) 10 $250.00 $2,500.00] $250.00 $2,500.00| $850.00 $8,500.00] $750.00 $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
H. [Turn Lane-Use Arrow 8ft (EA) 60 $55.00 $3,300.00| $155.00 $9,300.00] $250.00 $15,000.00| $175.00 $10,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Through Lane-Use Arrow 9.5ft
. |(EA) 10 $40.00 $400.00 $50.00 $500.00| $225.00 $2,250.00| $160.00 $1,600.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Turn and Through-Lane Use
J. |Amow (EA) 10 $75.00 $750.00] $170.00 $1,700.00| $400.00 $4,000.00| $325.00 $3,250.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
K. |Speed Hump Markings (EA) 100 $220.00] $22,000.00] $220.00| $22,000.00| $120.00 $12,000.00] $120.00 $12,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
L. |Bicycle Lane Markings (EA) 60 $370.00 $22,200.00] $370.00| $22,200.00| $280.00 $16,800.00) $230.00 $13,800.00] No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
M. |Shared Lane Markings (EA) 40 $370.00{ $14,800.00] $370.00| $14,800.00| $140.00 $5,600.00{ $100.00 $4,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Yield Line Marking 12in x 18in
segment (MUTCD Fig 3B-
N. |16(a)) 60 $20.00 $1,200.00 $20.00 $1,200.00 $45.00 $2,700.00| $35.00 $2,100.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Yield Line Marking 24in x 36in
segment (MUTCD Fig 3B-
Q. |16(b)) 30 $25.00 $750.00 $25.00 $750.00] $50.00 $1,500.00| $40.00 $1,200.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Two-Lane SCHOOL Marking
P. |(MUTCD Fig 7C-1) 4 $310.00] $1,240.00] $310.00| $1,240.00] $800.00 $3,200.00| $600.00 $2,400.00( No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Thermoplastic Removal |(Cleanup and proper disposal of debris is the responsibility of the contractor.)
Removal of pavement
markings based on a 4" wide
Q. |line per linear foot 75,000 $0.45| $33,750.00 $0.45| $33,750.00] $0.78 $58,500.00] $0.78 $58,500.00f No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of "Amow" pavement
R. |marking symbol 50 $20.00]  $1,000.00 $20.00f $1.000.00| $75.00 $3,750.00] $75.00 $3,750.00f No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Removal of "Only" pavement
S. |marking legend 20 $10.00 $200.00 $10.00 $200.00] $85.00 $1,700.00] $85.00 $1,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
| |GRAND TOTAL $211,065.001 I $207,190.00 528?,950.001 | $276,550.00




SECTION TWO - RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS - CLASS C BID 202143

ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY ROADSAFE TRAFFIC SYSTEMS DIRECT TRAFFIC CONTROL, RUDY CONSTRUCTION | o\ o srcorvica@potiersbisads.c _ N 7
Oklahoma City, OK Tulsa, OK INC. COMEANY om sharonp@eplanning.com
! 4 Oklahoma City, OK -
Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer
ITEM QUANTITY| PRICE | TOTAL |[PRICE | TOTAL |PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
A.) Installation of Ennis- NO
Flint Mode! 201 400 NO BID BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
B.) Replacement of lens NO
Ennis-Flint Model 201 50| $15.00)  $750.00] $15.00 | $750.00] $60.00] $3,000.00 NO BID BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL $750.00 $750.00 $3,000.00




