SECTION ONE - PAVEMENT MARKINGS BID 1819-46

RUDY
ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY DIRECT TRAFFIC CONTROL, INC. ROADSAFE TRAFFIC SYSTEMS CONSTRUCTION
QOklahoma City, OK Okahoma City, OK Tuisa, OK COMPANY
Oklahoma City, OK
Plastic Muiti-Polymer Piastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-
Polymer
ESTIMATED
ITEM QUANTITY | PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL NO BID NO BID
Pavement Markings
A 4" Wide Line {LF) 70,000 $0.70| $49,000.00 $0.70] $49,000.00 $0.68 $47,600.00 $0.68| $47,600.00 §0.75] $52,500.00 $0.75| $52,500.00| NOBID NO BID
B. [6” wide Line {LF) 500 50.71 $355.00 $0.71 $355.00 $0.70 $350.00 $0.70 $350.00 $1.12 $560.00 $1.12 $560.00{ NOBID NO BID
C. j8" wide Line {L.F) 3,000 $1.20 $3,600.00 $1.20 $3,800.00 $1.15 $3,450.00 $1.15 $3,450.00 $1.50 $4,500.00 $1.50 $4,500,00{ NOBID NO BID
D. {12" Wide Line (LF) 500 $1.25 $625.00 §1.25 $625.00| $1.20 $600.00 $1.20 $600.00 $2.25 51,125.00 $2.25 $1,125.00] NOBID NO BID
E. j24" Wide Line (LF) 4,000 $5.00f $20,000.00 $5.00| $20,000.00 $4.50 $18,000.00 $4.50] $18,000.00 $7.50 $30,000.00 $7.50] $30,000.00] NO BID NO BID
F. |ONLY 8ft X 5.9ft (EA) 10 $40.00 $400.00f $40.00 $400.00 $40.00 $400.00{ $40.00 $400.00| $125.00 $1,250.00| $125.00 $1,250.00] NO BID NO BID
Grade Crossing (RXR) 8t X
G. |20 {EA} 10 | $250.00 $2,500.00| $250.00 $2,500.00| $225.00 $2,250.00] $225.00 $2,250.00| $750.00 $7,500.00| $750.00 $7,5600.00] NOBID NO BID
K. ITumn Lane-Use Arrow 8it (EA) 60 | $100.00| $8,000.00| $100.00| $6,000.00| $95.00 $5,700.00]  $95.00 $5,700.00( $100.00 $6,000.00] $100.00 $6,000,00{ NO BID NO BID
Thraugh Lane-Use Amow 9.5/
l. [EA) 10 $55.00 $550.00| $55.00 $550.00| $50.00 $500.00| $50.00 $500.00| $100.00 $1,000.00| $100.00 $1,000.00{ NO BID NG BID
Tum and Through-Lane Use
J. Jamow {EA} 10 | $120.00 $1,200.00( $120.00 $1,200.00| $120.00 $1,200.00] $120.00 $1,200.00 $175.00 $1,750.00] $175.00 $1,750.00] NOBID NG BID
K. iSpeed Hump Markings {EA} 100 | $220.00 $22,000.00| $220.00| $22,000.00] $215.00 | $21,500.00] $215.00] $21,500.00| $350.00| $35,000.00f $450.00{ $45.000.00] NOBID NG BID
l.. [Bicycle Lane Markings (EA) 60 { $370.00( $22,200.00| $370.00| $22,200.00{ $365.00 $21,900.00] $365.00f $21,000.00| B3400.00| $24,000.00} $400.00{ $24,000.00] NO BID NO BID
M. IShared Lane Markings (EA) 40 { $370.00( $14,800.00| $370.00| $14,800.00{ $365.00 $14,600.00] $365.00f $14,600.00| $425.00| $17,000.00f $425,00| $17,000.00] NO BID NO BID
Yield Line Marking 12in x £8in
segment (MUTCD Fig 3B-
N. [16(a}) 60{ $20.00 $1,200.00 $20.00 $1,200.00{ $18.00 $1,080.00f $18.00 51,080.00 $50.00 $3,000.00 $40.00 $2,400.00| NO BID NO BID
Yield Line Marking 24in x 36in
segment (MUTCD Fig 38-
Q. |18(b)) 30] $25.00 $750.00| $25.00 $750.00] %$23.00 $6980.00f $23.00 $640.00 $75.00 $2,250.00 $60.00 $1,800.00) NO BID NO BID
Two-Lane SCHOOL Marking
P. [(MUTCD Fig 7C-1) 4{ $310.00 $1,240.00| $310.00 $1,240.00] $300.00 $1,200.00} $300.00 $1,200.00{ $700.00 $2,800.00( $500.00 $2,000,00( NOBID NO BID

Thermoplastic Removal

{Cleanup and proper disposal of debris is the 1

gsponsibility of the contractor.)

Remaoval of pavement
markings based on a 4" wide

50.35{ $26,250.00 $0.35} §26,250.00

NG BID NG BID

Q. |line per linear foot 75,000 $0.34] $28,500.00 $0.34] $25,500.00 $0.32| $24,000.00 $0.32| $24,000.00
Remaoval of "Arrow" pavement

R. [marking symbol 50 | $40.00] $2,000.00{ $40.00] $2,000.00 $38.00| $1,900.00| $38.00 $1,900.00 $50.00 $2,500.00| $50.00| $2,500.00) NOBID NGO BID
Removal of "Only” pavement

S. |marking legend 20 $12.00 $240.00{ $12.00 $240.00 $10.00 $200.00| $10.00 $200.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $1,000.00| NOBID NO BID

[GrAND TOTAL

| $174,160.00] | $174,160.00

§167,120.00] | $167,120.00|

| s219,985.00 | | s228,135.00




SECTION TWO - RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS - CLASS C BID 1819-46

ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY DIRECT TRAFFIC CONTROL | ROADSAFE TRAFFIC SYSTEMS RUDY CONSTRUCTION
COklahoma City, OK Muskogee, OK Tulsa, OK COMPANY
¥ gee, ’ Oklahoma City, OK
Plastic Multi- Plastic Multi- Plastic Muiti- Plastic Multi-
Polymer Polymer Polymer Polymer
ITEM QUANTITY| PRICE TOTAL |PRICE|TOTAL| PRICE TOTAL PRICE |TOTAL NO BID NO BID

Type 1 (EA) 400| $68.00] $27,200.00 $63.00F $25,200.00 NO BID NO BID

Type 2 (EA) 200| $68.00] $13,600.00 $63.00; $12,600.00 NO BID NO BID

Type 1 Refurbished (EA) 200| $68.00] 3$13,600.00 $63.00] $12,600.00 NO BID NO BID

Type 2 Refurbished (EA) 100| $68.00 $6,800.00 $63.00 $6,300.00 NO BID NO BID

Lens Replacement Class

C Type 1 {EA)} 100 $8.00 $800.00 $7.50 $750.00 NO BID NO BID

Lens Replacement Class

C Type 2 (EA) 100 $8.00 $800.00 $7.50 $750.00 NO BID NO BID

GRAND TOTAL $62,800.00 $58,200.00

Forwarded by: Dennis Davis, Traffic Control Supervisor




