

STREET DIVISION				
PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE -- BID NUMBER 1213-13				
BID TABULATION - Bid Opening September 13, 2012				
DESCRIPTION	KUDRON READY MIX, Oklahoma City, OK 73172, WITH Norman Plant	METHENY CONCRETE PRODUCTS, INC., Oklahoma City, OK 73129, WITH Norman Plant	DOLESE BROS. CO., Oklahoma City, OK 73101, WITH Norman Plant	VAN EATON READY MIX, Shawnee, OK, WITH Norman Plant
	PER CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD	PER CUBIC YARD
NOTE: TRANSPORTATION COST INCLUDED IN ALL SECTIONS ON CONCRETE				
SECTION I	CLASS A CONCRETE			
A. Class A Concrete less than 5 cubic yards	\$150.00	\$ 91.00 \$ 94.50 A & C \$ 97.50 A & D	\$129.10 1 CYD \$104.10 2 CYD \$ 95.77 3 CYD \$ 91.60 4 CYD	\$ 80.00
B. Class A Concrete 5 cubic yards or greater	\$81.00	\$ 86.00	\$ 89.10	\$ 80.00
C. One-percent Calcium Chloride added	\$83.50	\$ 89.50	\$ 91.60	\$ 82.50
D. Two-percent Calcium Chloride added	\$86.00	\$ 92.50	\$ 94.10	\$ 85.00
SECTION II	HIGH EARLY STRENGTH CONCRETE			
A. High Early strength Concrete less than 5 cubic yards.	\$ 156.00	\$ 101.00	\$141.30 1 CYD \$116.30 2 CYD \$107.97 3 CYD \$103.80 4 CYD	\$ 90.00
B. High Early Strength Concrete 5 cubic yards or greater	\$ 86.00	\$ 96.00	\$ 101.30	\$ 90.00
SECTION III	FAST-TRACK CONCRETE			
A. Fast-Track Concrete less than 5 cubic yards.	\$ 200.00	No Bid	\$198.40 1 CYD \$177.30 2 CYD \$164.97 3 CYD \$160.90 4 CYD	\$ 200.00
B. Fast-Track Concrete 5 cubic yards or greater	\$ 200.00	No Bid	\$ 158.40	\$ 200.00
SECTION IV	5-SACK GROUT MIX			
A. 5-Sack Grout Mix less than 5 cubic yards.	\$ 190.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 75.00
B. 5-Sack Grout Mix 5 cubic yards or greater	\$ 90.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 75.00
SECTION V	FLOWABLE FILL			
A. Flowable Fill less than 5 cubic yards.	\$ 142.00	\$ 80.00	\$119.55 1 CYD \$ 94.55 2 CYD \$ 86.22 3 CYD \$ 82.05 4 CYD	\$ 70.00
B. Flowable Fill 5 cubic yards or greater	\$ 72.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 79.55	\$ 70.00

VENDOR	Schwarz Ready Mix	No Response		
Recommendation: Bid Number 1213-13 be awarded as follows:				
Section I-A, II-A, V-A	Van Eaton Ready Mix	Lowest bidder		
	Metheny Concrete Products, Inc.	First Alternate bidder		
	Dolese Bros. Co.	Second Alternate bidder		
Section I-B, I-C, I-D, V-B	Van Eaton Ready Mix	Lowest bidder		
	Kudron Ready Mix	First Alternate bidder		
	Metheny Concrete Products, Inc.	Second Alternate bidder		
Section II-B	Kudron Ready Mix	Lowest bidder		
	Van Eaton Ready Mix	First Alternate bidder		
	Metheny Concrete Products, Inc.	Second Alternate bidder		
Section III-A, III-B	Dolese Bros. Co.	Lowest bidder		
	Kudron Ready Mix and Van Eaton Ready Mix	First Alternate bidders		
Section IV-A, IV-B	Van Eaton Ready Mix	Lowest bidder		
	Kudron Ready Mix	First Alternate bidder		