Section I: Unleaded
Price per gallon on August 2,

Award to:

Freight:

Surcharge on Freight:
Profit Margin:

2016 for full load of 10,000 gallons: $1.58

Red Rock Distributing Company
0.0190
0.0038
0.0050

Above rack bid total:

Bob Tail Delivery
Freight:

Surcharge on Freight:
Profit Margin:

0.0278

0.0000
0.0000
0.1000

Above rack bid total:

Section I1: Diesel
Price per gallon on August 2,

Award to:

Freight:

Surcharge on Freight:
Profit Margin:

0.1000

2016 for full load of 10,000 gallons: $1.40

Red Rock Distributing Company
0.02190
0.00438
0.00500

Above rack bid total:
Winter Blend additive:

0.03128
0.02500 (used during winter months)

Bob Tail Delivery
Freight:

Surcharge on Freight:
Profit Margin:

0.0000
0.0000
0.1000

Above rack bid total:

Account:
Account Name:
Account Budget:

0.1000

010-5073-435.31-18
Outside Fuel Inventory
$1,404,612



CITY OF NORMAN

BID TABULATION

BID #1617-02

Transport Delivery Fees with Cost Plus Methodology

Diesel Diesel
Unleaded Unleaded Diesel Diesel Winter Blend Winter Blend
Bidder Transport Truck Bobtail Truck Transport Truck Bobtail Truck Transport Truck Bobtail Truck
Red Rock
Distributing
OKC, OK $0.0278 $0.1000 $0.03128 $0.1000 $0.1250 $0.0563
Mansfield Oil
Company
Gainesville, GA | $0.0377 $0.2796 $0.0410 $0.2796 $0.2796 $0.0585
Petroleum
Traders
Corporation
Fort Wayne, IN | $0.0594 $0.1950 $0.0604 $0.1950 $0.1950 $0.0754
BID TABULATION
BID #1617-02
Transport Delivery Fees with Revenue Minus Methodology
Diesel Diesel
Unleaded Unleaded Diesel Diesel Winter Blend Winter Blend
Bidder Transport Truck Bobtail Truck Transport Truck Bobtail Truck Bobtail Truck Transport Truck
Mansfield Oil
Company
Gainesville, GA | $0.0022 $0.2796 $0.0130 $0.2796 $0.2796 $0.0305
Petroleum
Traders
Corporation . . . . . .
Fort Wayne, IN | No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Red Rock
Distributing . . . . . .
OKC, OK No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid
Mike White

Fleet Superintendent




