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 Bernie Mathes 
Trucking, 

Wheatland, OK 

 Dale Brown Inc. 
Ardmore, OK 

 Joe Brown 
Company Inc. 
Ardmore, OK 

 T.J. Campbell 
Construction Co., 

Oklahoma City, OK 

 Silver Star 
Construction Co., 

Moore, OK 

SECTION DESCRIPTION $ Per Ton $ Per Ton $ Per Ton $ Per Ton $ Per Ton

SECTION I 703.08 B, Class B 
Bedding Material
Delivered 15.70$            20.00$           12.75$           No Bid No Bid

SECTION II  703.04, Aggregate size 
#1 Washed Chips  

 Delivered 19.25$            23.40$           22.50$           No Bid No Bid

SECTION III 701.05 Fine Aggregate 
for concrete   

 Delivered 15.00$            20.00$           20.35$           No Bid No Bid

SECTION IV 703.01, Aggregate 
Base, Type A  

 Delivered 15.70$            20.00$           24.50$           15.24$                No Bid

SECTION V 
703-05, Traffic Bound 
Surface Course, Type 
A

 

 Delivered 17.95$            21.80$           24.50$           No Bid No Bid

SECTION VI 702.3, Cement Kiln 
Dust   

Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 52.02$                     

SECTION VII 705.01, Select Borrow 
Subgrade Material  

Delivered No Bid 11.50$           No Bid 6.24$                  No Bid

SECTION VIII 703.01, Aggregate 
Base, Type B  

 Delivered 15.70$            20.00$           24.50$           No Bid No Bid

SECTION IX 3-Inch Surge Rock, 
minimum fines    

Delivered 18.45$            20.90$           25.00$           No Bid No Bid
SECTION X 713.01, 8-inch Riprap    

Delivered 33.00$            32.00$           27.50$           No Bid No Bid
SECTION XI 713.01, 12-inch Riprap    

Delivered 33.00$            32.00$           35.75$           No Bid No Bid
SECTION XII 713.01, 18-inch Riprap  

Delivered 32.50$            32.00$           33.75$           No Bid No Bid
SECTION XIII Topsoil    

a.)  Pickup No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
b.)  Delivered No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

SECTION XIV Manufactured Sand, 
course    

Delivered 16.00$            20.00$           24.00$           No Bid No Bid

SECTION I

SECTION II

 Bernie Mathes Trucking, Alternate 
bidder Joe Brown Company, Inc.

BID TABULATION

Joe Brown Company, Alternate bidderBernie MathesTrucking Inc., Lowest 
bidder   

RECOMMENDATION -  Bid Number 1415-07 be awarded as follows:
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 Bernie Mathes 
Trucking, 

Wheatland, OK 

 Dale Brown Inc. 
Ardmore, OK 

 Joe Brown 
Company Inc. 
Ardmore, OK 

 T.J. Campbell 
Construction Co., 

Oklahoma City, OK 

 Silver Star 
Construction Co., 

Moore, OK 
BID TABULATION

SECTION III

SECTION IV
 SECTION V, VIII, 
IX, XIV 
SECTION VI,

SECTION VII

SECTION X

SECTION XI, XII

SECTION XIII A
SECTION XIII B

SECTION XIV

T. J. Campbell Construction Co., 

Silver Star Construction Co, Inc. Only 
bidder

Dale Brown Inc., Alternate bidder

 Bernie Mathes Trucking., Alternate 
bidder 
 Dale Brown Inc., Alternate bidder 

Bernie MathesTrucking Inc., Lowest 
bidder    Dale Brown Inc., Alternate bidder 

 No Bid 

Bernie MathesTrucking Inc., Lowest 
bidder   

No Bid

T. J. Campbell Construction Co., 
Lowest bidder     

No Bid

Dale Brown Inc., Alternate bidder

 No Bid 

Bernie MathesTrucking Inc., Lowest 
bidder   

Joe Brown Company, Inc. Dale Brown Inc., Alternate bidder

Dale Brown Inc., Lowest bidder      Bernie Mathes Trucking, Alternate 
bidder 


	1415-07 Tabulation 

