SECTION TWO - RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS - CLASS C BID #1213-42
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ITEM QUANTITY | PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL
Type 1 400 EA $75.00 $30,000.00 $35.00] $14,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 2 200 EA $75.00 $15,000.00 $35.00 $7,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 1 Refurbished 200 EA $75.00 $15,000.00 $55.00 $11,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 2 Refurbished 100 EA $75.00 $7,500.00 $55.00 $5.500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lens Replacement Class C Type 1 100 EA $10.00 $1.000.00 $9.00 $900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lens Replacement Class C Type 2 100 EA $10.00 $1,000.00 $9.00 $900.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL $69,500.00 $39,300.00

Forwarded by: Dennis Davis, Traffic Control Supervisor




