BID TABULATION STREET DIVISION -- PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE BID-2021-32
Active Nov. 1, 2020 to Oct. 31, 2021

KEY:{ PRIMARYBID | SECONDARYBID | TERTIARYBID |
METHENY CONCRETE
DOLESE BROS. CO., PRODUCTS, INC.,
DESCRIPTION OKC, OK 73101 OKC, OK 73129 VAN EATON READY MIX
WITH Norman Plant WITH Norman Plant SHAWNEE, OK 74802
235-2311 947-5566 405-214-7450

NOTE: TRANSPORTATION COST INCLUDED IN ALL SECTIONS ON CONCRETE

SECTION | CLASS A CONCRETE

A. Class A Concrete
Less than 5 cyds

B. Class A Concrete
5 cyds or more

SECTION 11 HIGH EARLY STRENGTH CONCRETE
A. High Early strength Concrete

$116.00 $108.00 $129.00

$116.00 $108.00 $119.00

130.0 No Bid 137.00

Less than 5 cyds $130.00 o ’

B. High Early Strength Concrete $120.00 No Bid $127.00
5 cyds or more

SECTION I11

A. Fast-Track Concrete $289.50 No Bid $360.00
Less than 5 cyds

B. Fast-Track Concrete $279.50 No Bid $325.00

5 cyds or more
SECTION IV 5-SACK GROUT MIX
A. 5-Sack Grout Mix

Less than 5 cyds $111.55 $116.00 $139.00
B. 5-Sack Grout Mix $101.55 $116.00 $129.00
5 cyds or more
SECTION V FLOWABLE FILL
A. Flowable Fill
Less than 5 cyds $115.00 $87.00 $113.00
B. Flowable Fill $105.00 $87.00 $103.00
5 cyds or more
SECTION VI ADDITIVES/ACCELERATORS
A, lce 90 Degrees 17.00 24.00 $20.00 $16.00
Ice 85 Degrees
B. Hot Water (Per Yard) 4.50 3.50 4.25
C. 1% NCA (Per cy) 4.00 4.00 4.00
D. 2% NCA (Per cy) 8.00 7.00 8.00
E. Straight Cement (Per cy) 4.00 4.00 5.00
F. Retarder 1% (Per cy) unlimited 1.50 2.50
G. Retarder 2% (Per cy) 3.00 5.00
H. Midrange Water Reducer (Per 3.00 4.00 3.00

cy)




	Bid 1718-22 TAB

