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BID TABULATION                            
Bid 1415-32 -- Bid 

Opening December 11, 
2014

Haskell Lemon 
Construction Co., 
Oklahoma City, 
Oklahoma and 

Plant in Norman, 
Oklahoma

Paving Materials, 
Inc., Moore, 
Oklahoma

T. J. Campbell 
Asphalt Co., 

Oklahoma City, 
Oklahoma

Vance Bros., Inc. 
Tulsa, Oklahoma

Paving 
Maintenance 
Supply, Inc., 

Edmond, 
Oklahoma

Logan County 
Asphalt, Guthrie, 

Oklahoma

SECTION I

Zone 1 51.85$                  45.60$                 47.13$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 2 51.60$                  45.95$                 46.71$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 3 53.25$                  47.42$                 48.40$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 4 52.35$                  47.26$                 48.57$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 5 51.40$                  48.88$                 47.41$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid

Batch Plant 47.00$                  41.00$                 42.70$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
B.  Superpave Asphalt Type - S4    

Zone 1 56.60$                  53.60$                 55.48$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 2 56.35$                  53.95$                 55.06$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 3 58.00$                  55.42$                 56.75$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 4 57.10$                  55.26$                 56.92$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 5 56.15$                  56.88$                 55.76$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid

Batch Plant 51.75$                  49.00$                 51.05$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
   

Zone 1 58.35$                  56.50$                 58.53$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 2 58.10$                  56.85$                 58.11$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 3 59.75$                  58.32$                 59.80$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 4 58.85$                  58.16$                 59.97$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 5 57.90$                  59.78$                 58.81$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid

Batch Plant 53.50$                  51.90$                 54.10$                      No Bid No Bid No Bid

Section II -- Emulsified Asphalt, SS-1 or Equal
A. Delivered and 
Applied No Bid 4.50$                   No Bid  No Bid No Bid No Bid

B.  Pickup at plant 2.50$                    3.00$                   No Bid 2.40$                      No Bid No Bid

Section III -- Container Patch Mix

A.  Pickup at plant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.54/per bag 10.75/Bag
Less than 50 

containers/bags

B. 50 LB Bags (One or 
more pallets) 
Delivered to

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.64/per bag 12.75/

668 E. Lindsey  50 bags minimum
Norman, OK  73069  

C.  Bulk 
Pickup at plant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 93.50/ton 99.75/ton

D.  Bulk delivered to
668 E. Lindsey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 105.54/ton 108.25/ton

Norman, OK  73069 25 ton minimum

A.    Superpave Asphalt Type - S-3

C.  Superpave Asphalt Type - S5
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RECOMMENDATION:

Section I,   A. Zones 1, 2, 
3, 4,  and Batch Plant

Section I,   A. Zone 5  

Section I,   B.  Zones 
1,2,3,4, and Batch Plant

 

Section I,   B. Zone 5  

Section I,   C.  Zones 1, 
2, 3, 4, and Batch Plant

Section I,   C.  Zone 5

RECOMMENDATION:

Section II A.  
Delivered and applied 
UBP per gallon   

Section II B. Pickup at 
plant UBP per gallon

RECOMMENDATION:

Section III    A.,  B.,  
C.  and D.

T. J. Campbell Construction Co., Lowest bidder

Haskell Lemon Construction Co.,  First alternate bidder
Paving Materials, Inc., Second alternate bidder

Haskell Lemon Construction Co., First Alternate bidder
Paving Materials, Inc., Second Alternate bidder

 Vance Oil Co., Lowest bidder

Bid 1415-32 Section II  be awarded as follows:

T. J. Campbell Construction Co., First Alternate bidder
Haskell Lemon Construction Co., Second alternate bidder

T. J. Campbell Construction Co.,  First alternate bidder
Haskell Lemon Construction Co., Second alternate bidder

Bid Number 1415-32 be awarded as follows:

Paving Materials, Inc., Lowest bidder

Paving Materials, Inc., Lowest Bidder

T. J. Campbell Construction Co., Lowest bidder

Paving Materials, Inc.,  First alternate bidder
Haskell Lemon Construction Co., Second alternate bidder

Logan County Asphalt, Alternate bidder

Paving Materials, Inc., Only bidder

Paving Materials, Inc., Lowest Bidder

Haskell Lemon Construction Co., First Alternate bidder
T.  J. Campbell Construction Co., Second alternate bidder

Haskell Lemon Construction Co., Lowest Bidder

T.J. Campbell Construction Co., First alternate bidder
Paving Materials, Inc., Second alternate bidder

 Paving Maintenance Supply, Inc. Lowest bidder

Bid 1415-32 Section III  be awarded as follows:
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