TRAFFIC SIGN FACES - PER SQUARE FOOT

BID NO. 1213-23

SAFEWAY SIGN | /)| caN siGNs LT HALL SIGNS, INC INTERSTATE ROCAL,INC  |TIME STRIPING, INC
KQRP (Foley, AL)  |PRODUCTSCORPI gy ington, In) | HIGHWAY SIGN | o b oH) | (Sallisaw, OK)
(Adelanto, CA) (Jackson, MS) CORP (Little
Rock, AR)
ITEM PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
I SEG SHEETING - ONE COLOR INK $1.38 $1.37 $2.25 $1.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID
. SEGSHEETING - TWO COLORS INK $1.48 $1.57 $2.52 $1.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID
ll.  SEG SHEETING - THREE COLORS INK $1.58 $1.77 $2.83 $1.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID
IV.  HIGH INTENSITY SHEETING - ONE COLOR INK $1.88 $1.62 $1.70 $1.92 NO BID NO BID NO BID
V. HIGH INTENSITY SHEETING - TWO COLORS INK $1.98 $1.65 $1.88 $2.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID
VI.  HIGH INTENSITY SHEETING - THREE COLORS INK $2.08 $1.85 $2.64 $2.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID
VIl.  DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING - ONE COLOR INK $3.88 $3.72 $3.94 $5.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
VIll.  DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING - TWO COLORS INK $3.98 $3.80 $4.02 $5.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID
[X.  DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING - FLUORESCENT
YELLOW - GREEN $4.33 $4.14 $4.34 $5.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
X.  DIAMOND GRADE SHEETING - FLUORESCENT
YELLOW - GREEN TWO COLORS INK $4.43 $5.27 $4.42 $6.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID

It is recommended that Bid No. 1213-23 be awarded as follows: SAFEWAY SIGN CORP: Sections |1, 11l and X; VULCAN SIGNS: Sections I, IV, V, VI, VII, VIl and IX.

Forwarded by: Dennis W. Davis, Traffic Control Supervisor



