
STREET DIVISION
PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE BID-1516-11

BID TABULATION - Bid Opening September 10, 2015

KEY: PRIMARY BID SECONDARY BID

DESCRIPTION
DOLESE BROS. CO.,          

OKC, OK  73101                  
WITH Norman Plant

METHENY CONCRETE 
PRODUCTS, INC.,                    

OKC, OK 73129                                   
WITH Norman Plant

VAN EATON READY MIX,  
Shawnee, OK  74801             
WITH Norman Plant

SECTION I
A. Class A Concrete                                    

 Less than 5 cyds
B. Class A Concrete   

 5 cyds or more

C. Add 1% Calcium Chloride $3.00 $4.00 $4.00

D. Add 2% Calcium Chloride $5.75 $8.00 $8.00

SECTION II

A. High Early strength Concrete 

 Less than 5 cyds

B. High Early Strength Concrete

 5 cyds or more

SECTION III
A. Fast-Track Concrete              

 Less than 5 cyds
B. Fast-Track Concrete                    

 5 cyds or more

SECTION IV
A. 5-Sack Grout Mix                  

 Less than 5 cyds
B. 5-Sack Grout Mix                     

 5 cyds or more
SECTION V
A. Flowable Fill                       

 Less than 5 cyds
B. Flowable Fill                                

 5 cyds or more

VENDOR

Section IV:  A & B Only Bidder -         Dolese Bros Co.

Section III:  A & B

Lowest Bidder -     Metheny Concrete Products, Inc.

$350.00

$325.00$245.00$170.40

Alternate Bidder - Dolese Bros Co. & Van Eaton Ready Mix.           

Recommendation:  BID-1516-11 be awarded as follows:

FLOWABLE FILL
$98.00 $82.50

 Section II:  B

Lowest Bidder -     Dolese Bros Co. & Metheny Concrete Products, Inc..           

Alternate Bidder - Van Eaton Ready Mix

Lowest Bidder -     Metheny Concrete Products, Inc.

Alternate Bidder -Metheny Concrete Products, Inc.

 No Bid No Bid $100.00

5-SACK GROUT MIX

Lowest Bidder -     Dolese Bros Co.

$98.00

NOTE:  TRANSPORTATION COST INCLUDED IN ALL SECTIONS ON CONCRETE

David Kudron Ready Mix and Schwarz Ready Mix - No Response                                                               

$93.00$82.50$88.00

Alternate Bidder -Metheny Concrete Products, Inc. Section II:  A

FAST-TRACK CONCRETE

$114.00 $125.00 

$104.00 $114.00 $114.00

$125.00

HIGH EARLY STRENGTH CONCRETE

 CLASS A CONCRETE

$114.00 

$124.00

$110.00 No Bid No Bid

$127.00 $135.00

$115.00 $127.00

$180.40 $245.00

Section V:   A

Section V:   B Alternate Bidder - Dolese Bros Co. 

Alternate Bidder - Van Eaton Ready MixSection I:     A

Lowest Bidder -     Dolese Bros Co.Section I:     B - D

Alternate Bidder - Van Eaton Ready Mix

Lowest Bidder -     Dolese Bros Co.

Lowest Bidder -     Dolese Bros Co.
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