SECTION ONE - PAVEMENT MARKINGS #1415-40

ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY BIRECT TRAFFIC CONTROL, iNC. ROADSAFE TRAFFIC SYSTEMS TIME STRIPING
Oklahoma City, OK Okahoma City, OK Tulsa, OK Van Buren, AR
Plastic Multi-Palymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer
ESTIMATED
ITEM QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL FRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
Pavement Markings
4" Wids Line 70.000 LF 80.65|  $45,500.00 80.85|  $59,500.00 $1.65| $115,600.00 $2.10 5147,000.00 $0.65| $45,500.00 NQ BID NOQ BID NO BID
8" Wide Line 3000 LF $1.65 $4,850.00 $1.85 $6,560.00 $3.00) $9,000.00 $4.25 $12,750.00 $1.30) $3.8900.00 NO BID NQ EID NO BID
12" Wids Line 500 LF $2.00 $1,000.00 $2.50 $1,250.00 $3.78] $1,875.00 $7.5G 53,750.00 $1.95] 5975.00 NG BID NO BID NO BID
24" Wide Line 4,000 LF| $12.50 $50,000.00 $18.00 $72,000.00 $12.00| $48,000.00 $14.00 $64,000.00 $3.80| $15.600.00 NG BID NO BID NO BID
4" Wide Ling (thin ling-half thickness) 5.000 LF| S0.65 £3.250.00 NIA N/A §1.50| $7,500.00 NfA N/A $0.50| $2,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Word *ONLY* 10 EA $225.00 $2.250.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $250.00| 52,500.00 $400.00 $4,000.00 $150,00| $1,300.00 NG BID NO BID NO BID
Railrpad Crossing Symbol 10 EA $750.00 37.500.00 $1,200.00] $12,000.00 $550.00| $5.500.00 $750.00 $7,500.00 $650.00] $6,500.C0 NO BID NOQ EID NQ BID
Tum Arrow 100 EA $100.0¢ 510,000.00 $185.00] $18,500.00 $175.00] $17,500.00 $250.00 $25,000.00 $100.00] $10,000.00 NC BID NO BID NO BID
Straight Arrow 10 EA $100.0¢ £1,000.00 $185.00 $1,850.00 $175.00| 51,750.00 $250.00 $2,500.00 $90.00) S900.00 NC BID NO BID NO 8ID
Cambinalion Arrow 10 EA $125.00 $1,260.00 5225.00 $2,250.00 $205.00| $2,250.00 $350.00 $3,500.60 $175.00] $1,750.00 NC BID NO BID NO 81D
Speed Hump Markings 100 EA $300.00|  $30,000.00 $1,000.00]  $100.000.00 $225.00| $22,500.00 $500.00 $50,000.00 $320.00] $32,000.00 NC BID NQO BID NO 81D
Bicycle Lane Markings 60 EA $450.00|  $27,000.00 $600.00 $36,000.00 $575.00| $34,500.00 $700.00 $42,000.00 $745.00] S44,700.00 NO BID NO BID NO 81D
Shared Lane Markings 100 EA $450.00)  $45,000.00 $600.00 $60,000.00 $600.00| $80,000.00 $700.00 $70,000.00 $525.00| $52,500.00 NG BID NO BID NO BID
Thermopiastic Removal
Themnoplasiic Rernaval 75,000 LF $0.45| $33,750.00) $0.45 $33,750,00 $1,50| $112,500.00 $1.50 $112,500.00 $0.45| $33,750.00 NC BID NO BID NO BID
Removal of "ARRCW" Pavement Marking
Symbol 50 £A $25.00 £1,250.00] 325,00 $1,250.00 $50.00) §2,500.00 $50.00 $2,800.00 $50.00| $2,500.00 NG BID NO BID NO 8ID
Remeoval of "OMLY" Pavement Marking
Legend 20 EA $25.08] $500.00 $25.00 $500.00 $75.00] $1.500.00 $75.00 $1,500.00 $50.00) $1,000.00 NC BID NO BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL $264,200.00 $408,400,00 5444,875.00 $548,500.00 $255,375.,00 NC BID NO BID NO BID

Forwarded by: Dennis Davis, Traflic Control Supeivisor




SECTION TWO - RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS - CLASS C BID #1415-40

ACTION SAFETY SUPFLY DIRECT TRAFFIC CONTROL ROADSAFE TRAFFIC SYSTEMS TIME STRIPING
Oklahoma City, OK Muskoges, OK Tulsa, OK Van Buren, AR
Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer
ITEM GUANTITY PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
Type i 400 EA $100.00]  $40,000.00 N/A N/A $125.00] $50,600.00 $125.00 NOQ 81D NO BID NO BID NO BID
Type 2 200 EA 5100.00)  $20,000.00 WA N/A $150.00]  $30,000.00 $150.00 NO 81D NO BID NO BID NQ BID
Type 1 Relurbished 200 EA N/A N/A N/A N/A $150.00 $150,00 NOQ 81D NO BID NG BID NO BID
Type 2 Refurbished 100 EA N/A DN/A N7A N/A $50.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lens Replacement Class C Type 1 100 EA $15.00, $1,500.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $60.00 $5,000.00 $50,00] $5,000.00 NQ BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Lens Replacement Class C Type 2 100 EA $15.00] 51,500.00 $15.00 $1,500.00 $50.00 $5,000.00: $50.00] $5,000.00 NO BID NO BID NQ BID NO BID
GRAND TOTAL $63,000.00 $3,000.00 $90,000.00 $10,000.00

Forwardad by: Dennis Davis, Trallic Control Supervisor




