SECTION ONE - PAVEMENT MARKINGS #1516-46

ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY

DIRECT TRAFFIC CONTROL, INC.

ROADSAFE TRAFFIC SYSTEMS

RUDY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Oklahoma City, OK Okahoma City, OK--NO BID Tulsa, CK Oklahoma City, OK
Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer
ESTIMATED
ITEM QUANTITY | PRICE | TOTAL [PRICE]| TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL |PRICE| TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE TOTAL
Pavement Markings
4" Wide Line {LF) 70,000 $0.6515$45,500.00F  $0.85]$59,500.00 NO BID NO BID $0.65|545,500.00 NO BID $0.75{ $52,500.00 $0.75] $52,500.00
8" Wide Line {LF) 3,000 $1.65] $4,950.00f $1.85] $5,550.00 NQ BID NO BID $1.30 $3,80C.00 NO BID $1.50] $4,500.00 $1.50 $4,500.00
12" Wide Line (LF) 500 $2.00] $1,000.00F $2.50] $1,250.00 NO BID NO BID $1.95 $0975.00 NQ BID $2.25] $1,125.00 $2.25 $1,125.00
24" Wide Line (LF) 4,000 1 $12.501%$50,000.00F $18.00]$72,000.00 NO BID NO BID $3.90]515,600.00 NO BID $4.50} $18,000.00 $4.50]  $18,000.00
4" Wide Line {thin line-half thickness)(LF) 5,060 $0.65] $3,250.00F $0.00 $0.00 NO BID NO BID $0.50] £2,500.00 NO BID $0.75) $3,750.00 $0.75 $3.750.00
Word “CNLY" (EA) 10 { $125.00] $1,250.00§$125.00] $1,26C.00 NQ BID NO BID | $130.00 $1,300.00 NOBID | $95.00] $950.00f $85.00 $950.00
Railroad Crossing Symbol (EA) 10 | $500.00| $5,000.00) $500.00| §5,000.00 NO BID NO BID | $650.00] $6,500.00 NQ BID | 5225.00] $2,250.00] $225.00 $2,250.00
Tum Arrow (EA) 501 $95.00| $4,750.00F $95.00| $4,750.00 NO BID NQ BID | $100.00] $5,000.00 NO BID | $100.00] $5,000.00] $100.00 $5,000.00
Straight Arrow (EA) 0] $95.00] $950.00} $95.00( $950.00 NO BID NOBID | $90.00f $900.00 NO BID | $120.00] $1,200.00f $120.00 $1,200.00
Combination Arrow (EA) 10 { $190.00| $1,900.00; $190.00) $1,900.00 NO BID NO BID | $175.00] $1,750.00 NQ BID | $120.00 $1,200.00] $120.00 $1,200.00
Speed Hump Markings (EA) 50 1 $300.00|$15,000.00J $300.00( $15,000.00 NO BID NQ BiD | $320.00]%$16,000.00 NO BID | $210.00|$10,500.00| $210.00]  $10,500.00
Bicycle Lane Markings {EA) 50 | $450.00($22,500.00} $450.00{$22,500.00 NQ BID NO BID | $745.001 $37,250.00 NO BID | $375.00|%18,750.00| $375.00] $18,750.00
Shared Lane Markings (EA} 50 | $450.00]$22,500.00) $450.00) $22,500.00 NO BID NO BID | $525.00]| $26,250.00 NO BID | $375.00]$18,750.00f $375.00{ $18.750.00
Thermoplastic Removal

Thermoplastic Removal (LF} 75,000 $0.45|533,750.00] $0.45}$33,750.00 $0.00] NOBID NQ BID $0.451$33,750.00 NO BID $0.25{$18,750.00f $0.25] $18,750.00
Remaval of "ARHOW" Pavement Marking

Symbaol (EA)} 50| $25.00] $1,250.00| $25.00| $1,250.00 $0.00] NOBID NO BID $50.00] $2,500.00 NQBID | $25.00{ $1,250.0¢ $25.00 $1,250.00
Removal of "ONLY" Pavemnent Marking

Legend (EA} 20| $25.00] $500.00] $25.00 $500.00 $0.00] NOBID NO BID | $50.00] $1,000.00 NOBID | $20.00] $400.00 $20.00 $400.00
GRAND TOTAL $214,050.00, $247 650.00 NO BID NO BiD $200,675.00 NO BID $158,675.00, $158,875.00

Forwarded by: Dennis Davis, Traffic Contral Supervisor




