
NORMAN UTILITIES AUTHORITY

PROJECT WA0242I - ROBINSON WATER LINE REPLACEMENT PHASE III

CONTRACT K-2021-1

BID 2021-1

Bid Opening Date June 11, 2020

Bid Opening Time 2:00 PM

Company Address Total Base Bid Alternate 1

Total Base Bid + 

Alternate 1 Alternate 2

Total Base Bid + 

Alternate 2

Engr. Est. – Plummer -  $            2,323,090.00  $            703,375.00  $            3,026,465.00  $            657,315.00  $            2,980,405.00 

Garney Companies, Inc.
1333 NW Vivion Road

Kansas City, MO
 $             1,400,090.00  $             577,733.00  $             1,977,823.00  $             578,785.00  $             1,978,875.00 

McKee Utility Contractors, Inc.
2319 W Main St

Prague, OK
 $             1,659,796.00  $             488,750.00  $             2,148,546.00  No Bid  No Bid 

4M Trenching, LLC
5321 SW 11th St

Oklahoma City, OK
 $             1,856,565.00  No Bid  No Bid  $             676,078.00  $             2,532,643.00 

Cimarron Construction Company
3501 NE 63rd St

Oklahoma City, OK
 $             2,080,330.00  $             509,025.00  $             2,589,355.00  $             469,210.00  $             2,549,540.00 

Matthews Trenching Co., Inc.
PO Box 15479

Oklahoma City, OK
 $             2,294,410.00  $             774,950.00  $             3,069,360.00  $             809,600.00  $             3,104,010.00 

Marsau Enterprises, Inc.
1209 N 30th St

Enid, OK
 $             3,018,253.10  $             876,262.51  $             3,894,515.61  $             706,522.51  $             3,724,775.61 


