
STREET DIVISION
INLET, FRAMES, GRATES AND CURB HOODS -- BID NUMBER 1516-12

Bid Opening:  September 10, 2015 
BID TABULATION

Page 1 of 1

KEY: PRIMARY BID SECONDARY BID

DESCRIPTION
OKLAHOMA CONTRACTORS 

SUPPLY LLC.                          
OKC, OK

FERGUSON WATER WORKS 
OKC, OK

CONTRACTORS SUPPLY              
OKC, OK

SECTION I
Heavy-duty cast iron                  3 

flange Inlet Frame. $125.00 $135.00 No Bid

SECTION II

Heavy-duty cast iron          
double unit (left & right)             

Inlet Frames*
$260.00 $274.26 No Bid

SECTION III

Heavy-duty cast iron         
Center Section Inlet Frames* $130.00 $140.13 No Bid

SECTION IV

Heavy-duty cast iron    Ribbed 
Vane Grate $140.00 $167.50 No Bid

SECTION V

Heavy-duty cast iron           Vane 
Grate $95.00 $87.50 No Bid

SECTION VI

A.  6” barrier cast iron   Curb 
Hood* $125.00 $126.06 No Bid

B.   8" barrier cast iron Curb 
Hood* $145.00 $137.91 No Bid

SECTION VII

2'x4' tile cast in place brick red $95.00 $115.00 $124.00

DETECTABLE WARNING SURFACE / ADA TRUNCATED DOME

Alternate Bidder - Ferguson Water Works

Lowest Bidder -     Ferguson Water Works

Recommendation - BID-1516-12 be awarded as follows:

Section I - IV,  VI A.,                & 
Section VII:

Lowest Bidder -     Oklahoma Contractors Supply LLC.

Section V & Section VI B.:
Alternate Bidder - Oklahoma Contractors Supply LLC.

ODOT DESIGN 1 INLET

ODOT DESIGN 2 INLET                                                                                            
(*includes all fastening hardware)

CENTER SECTION INLET FRAMES                                                                       
(*includes all fastening hardware)

HEAVY DUTY CAST IRON RIBBED GRATE

HEAVY DUTY CAST IRON VANE GRATE

HEAVY DUTY CAST IRON CURB HOODS                                                                                               
(*includes all fastening hardware)
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