BID TABULATION BID NO 1213-62
BID OPENING JANUARY 10, 2013

BID TABULATION ) ' T. J. Campbell Haskell ljemo‘n ' i - l"aung
Bid 1213-62 - Bid Paving Materials, Asphalt.Co., COI?structmn .(.o., Vance Qil (f)., Logan (‘ount}" aintenance
Opening January 10 Inc., Moore, Oklahoma City, Oklahoma City, Oklahoma City, Asphalt, Guthrie, Supply, Inc.,
’ Oklahoma Olihois 'Oklahoma and Plant Oklahoma Oklahoma Edmond,
2013 in Norman, Oklahoma Oklahoma
SECTION I
A. Superpave Asphalt Type - S-3

Zone 1| $ 5390 | $ 50.73 | 8 51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone2| $ 5425 % 503118 50.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone3| § 5573 | § 52.00 | § 52.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zoned| § 5556 | § 5217 § 51.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 5| § 5718 | § 51.01 1% 50.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Batch Plant| § 49.30 | § 4505 [ § 47.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

B. Superpave Asphalt Type - §4
Zonel| § 5850 8 62.73 | § 55.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zonel2| § 58858 62.31 | % 54.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone3| § 6033 | § 64.00 | § 56.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 4| § 60.16 | § 64.17 | $ 55.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 5| § 61.78 | § 63.01 | § 54.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Batch Plant| $ 5390 8 57.05| % 51.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

C. Superpave Asphalt Type - 85
Zonel| § 58.50 | § 6543 | § 58.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone?2| § 58.85 | $ 65.01 | $ 57.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 3| § 60.33 | $ 66.70 | $ 59.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 4] § 60.16 | § 66.87 | § 58.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Zone 5| § 61.78 | § 6571 | § 57.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Batch Plant| $ 53.90 | $ 5975 ( 8 54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
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BID TABULATION T.3. Campbenn | Haskell Lemon Paving
Bid 1213-62 — Bid Paving Materials, A ) halt gﬂe Construction Co., Vance Oil Co., Logan County Maintenance
) . Inc., Moore, O'Ials}ljl 4 (‘1; Oklahoma City, OKlahoma City, Asphalt, Guthrie, Supply, Inc.,
Opening January 10, | g13an0ma anoma i | Okiahoma and Plant | Oklahoma Oklahoma Ediond
2013 Oklahoma in N OKlah dmond,
in Norman, ahoma Oklahoma
Section II -- Emulsified Asphalt, S§-1 or Equal
iﬁgﬁfﬁmd Rud 4.50/Gal No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
B. Pickup at plant 3.00/Gal No Bid 2.50/Gal $ 2.20 No Bid No Bid
p
Section III -- Container Patch Mix
A. Pickup at plant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.75/Bag 8.54/Bag
Less than 50
containers/bags

B. 50 LB Bags (One or
more pallets) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.75/Bag 9.64/Bag
Delivered to

668 E. Lindsey

Norman, OK 73069

C. Bulk

Pickup at plant No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 99.75/ton 93.50/ton
D. Bulk delivered to

668 E. Lindsey No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 108.25/ton 105.54/ton

Norman, OK 73069 14 ton minimum




BID TABULATION BID NO 1213-62
BID OPENING JANUARY 10, 2013

BID TABULATION T.J. Campbenn | Haskell Lemon L
: . Paving Materials, | " 2" Construction Co., Vance Oil Co., Logan County Maintenance
Bid 1213-62 -- Bid Asphalt Co., i d .
Oticilise.J : Inc., Moore, Oklahoma City, Oklahoma City, Oklahoma City, Asphalt, Guthrie, Supply, Inc.,
pening January 10, Oklahoma OKlahoma | OXlahoma and Plan Oklahoma OKlahoma Edmond,
2013 in Norman, Oklahoma Oklahoma
RECOMMENDATION: |Bid Number 1213-62 be awarded as follows:

Section I, A.Zones 1,2,
3,4, 5 and Batch Plant

T. J. Campbell Asphalt Co., Lowest Bidder

Haskell Lemon Construction Co., First alternate bidder

Paving Materials, Inc., Second alternate bidder

Section I, B. Zones
1,2,3,4,5 and Batch Plant

Haskell Lemon Construction Co., Lowest Bidder

Paving Materials, Inc., First Alternate bidder

T. J. Campbell Construction Co., Second alternate bidder

Section I, C. Zones 1, 2,
3,4,and 5

Haskell Lemon Construction Co., Lowest Bidder

Paving Materials, Inc., First Alternate bidder

T. J. Campbell Construction Co., Second alternate bidder

Section I, C. Batch
Plant

Paving Materials, Inc., Lowest Bidder

Haskell Lemon Construction Co., First alternate bidder

T. J. Campbell Asphalt Co., Second alternate bidder

Cancellation Charges

Charges shown as per bidder is used as Lowest bidder, First alternate bidder and Second alternate bidder

RECOMMENDATION:

Bid 1213-62 Section II be awarded as follows:

Section I A,

Paving Materials, Inc., Only bidder

Section II B.

Vance Oil Co., Lowest bidder

Haskell Lemon Construction Co., First Alternate bidder

Paving Materials, Inc., Second Alternate bidder

RECOMMENDATION:

Bid 1213-62 Section III be awarded as follows:

I | |

Section III A., B.,
C. and D.

Paving Maintenance Supply, Inc. Lowest bidder

Logan County Asphalt, Alternate bidder
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