Norman Utilities Authority

FYE17 Sewer Maintenance Project (WWO0307)

Bid No. 1920-49

Bid Opening Date:

Thursday, March 12, 2020

Bid Opening Time: 2:00 PM
Company City State Total Base Bid Alternate Bid Base Bid + Alternate Bid

Horseshoe Construction, Inc. La Porte X $2,796,161.25 $392,030.00 $3,188,191.25

PM Construction & Rehab, LLC Pasadena TX $2,875,967.21 $347,224.76 $3,223,191.97
Jordan Contractors Tecumseh  OK $2,937,604.00 $322,230.00 $3,259,834.00
Urban Contractors, LLC OKC OK $3,555,927.00 $443,290.00 $3,999,217.00
Krapff-Reynolds Construction OKC OK $4,913,520.00 $417,410.00 $5,330,930.00
Matthews Trenching OKC OK No Bid No Bid No Bid

Vortex Companies Houston X No Bid No Bid No Bid
Engineer's Estimate $2,999,300.00 $422,570.00 $3,421,570.00




