LINE MAINTENANCE DIVISION —- TABULATION OF BIDS

COPPER METER YOKES FOR WATER METERS, HDPE METER BOXES WITH CAST [RON LIDS, AND WATER LINE REPAIR CLAMPS
BID NO. 1213-29- September 6, 2012

CKLAHOMA. FERGUSCN QKC PIONEER SUPPLY | AMERICAN WATERWORKS HD SUPPLY
ngpmcggs WATER WORKS | WINWATER WORKS SUPPLY, INC. WATERWORKS
i o o Oklahome Clty, OK Oklahoma City, OK Moare, Oldghoma Normen, OK Oklahoms City, QK
COPPER METER 93.00 ] :
SSOPFERMEIER 187.00 82.75 134.00 80.49 95.00
METERSKUNF[(TBPOR;:%E
HDPE METE S 45.50 48.00 46.
DREMETER 20t 6.47 49.40 44.96 46.50
LIDS/UNIT PRICE
W.L. REPAIR CLAMPS: 36.00 23.75 25.45 NO BID 25.06 2795
SECTION 1,2 INCH X 6
INCH/UNIT PRICE
SECTION 2 41.00 31.93 37.25 NO BID 31.92 37.20
4 x 6 INCH
SECTION 3 41.00 39.84 37.25 NO BID 39.84 42,90
4 X 8 INCH
SECTION 4 62.00 63.28 51.31 NO BID 63.28 58.50
4 X 12 INCH
SECTION § 47.00 47,67 38.33 NO BID 47.67 44.00
6 X 8 INCH
SECTION 6 75.50 76.13 53.39 NO BID 76.12 66.50
6 X 12 INCH
SECTION 7 91.50 83.97 68.08 NO BID 83.97 73,50
6 X 15 INCH
SECTION 8 121.00 126.65 84,29 NOBID 126.65 121.00
6 X 20 INCH
SECTION & 148,00 159.38 104.70 NO BID 159.38 145.00
6 X 24 INCH
SECTION 10 169.00 207.51 139,90 NO BID 207.50 161.50
6 X 30 INCH
SECTION 11 52.00 55.86 d48.95 NO BID 55.86 4820
8 X 8 INCH
SECTION 12 83.00 85.66 66.26 NO BID 89.66 71.35
§X 12 INCH
SECTION 13 101.00 102.46 88.53 NO BID 102.46 £8.45
8 X 15 INCH
SECTION 14 133.00 145.15 121.76 NO BID 145.14 120.50
8 X 20 INCH
SECTION 15 196.00 238.26 158.28 NO BID 238.26 201.00
8 X 30 INCH
SECTION 16 140.00 153.07 105.92 NO BID 153.07 128.40

12 X ISINCH




COPPER METER YOKES FOR WATE

LINE MAINTENANCE DIVISION ~ TABULATION OF BIDS

R METERS, HDPE METER BOXES WITH CAST IRON LIDS, AND WATER LINE REPATR CLAMPS
BID NO. 1213-29~ September 6, 2012
OKLAHOMA FERGUSON OKC PIONEER SUPPLY AMERICAN WATERWORKS HD SUPPLY
CONYRACTORS WATER WORKS | WINWATER WORKS SUPPLY, INC, WATERWORKS
SUPPLY, INC, Oklahoma City, OK. Oklghoma City, OK Moore, OK Norman, OK Oidahoma City, OK
Oklahoma City, OK
SECTION 17 191.00 212.58 146.62 NO BID 212,57 179.00
12 X 20 INCH
SECTION 18 229.00 252.46 151.47 NO BID 25246 248.75
12 X 24 INCH
SECTION 19 268.00 360.36 197.66 NO BID 350.35 282.00
12 X 30 INCH
SECTION 20 398.00 373.48 227.95 NO BID 373.48 269.00
14 X 20 INCH
SECTION 21 412.00 438.08 264.74 NO BID 438.08 299.40
16 X 20 INCH
SECTION 22 635.00 796.93 322,62 NO BID 796.92 477,00
16 X 30 INCH
SECTION 23 950.00 932,13 401.44 NO BID 932.12 850.00
24 X 24 INCH
SECTION 24 1008.00 1,722.72 776.45 NOBID 1,722.71 1,492.00
30 X 36 INCH
SECTION 25 70.00 40.21 33,18 NO BID 40.21 47.00
2X6X %" CC
Thread Tap
SECTION 26 73.00 70.33 5932 NOBID 70.32 55,70
2X 12'W/ 314 CC
Thread Tap
SECTION 27 70.00 40.21 33.18 NO BID 40.21 47.00
2X6 W CC
SECTION 28 73.00 70.33 59.32 NO BID 70,32 55.70
2X12wWr1'ce
SECTION 29 61.00 56.31 4530 NO BID 56.30 62.00
4XBWU"CC
SECTION 30 §3.00 7975 6140 NO BID 79.74 70.00
4 X 12 INCH W/ 314" CC
SECTION 31 61.00 56.31 47.70 NOBID 56,30 62.00
4 X8 INCHW 1"CC
SECTION 32 83.00 79.75 61.40 NO BID 79.74 70.00
4X12INCHW 1" CC
SECTION 33 70.00 64.14 47.70 NO BID 64.13 72.00

6 X 8 INCH W %"CC




LINE MAINTENANCE DIVISION — TABULATION OF BIDS
COPPER METER YOKES FOR WATER METERS, HDPE METER BOXES WITH CAST IRON LIDS, AND WATER LINE REPAIR CLAMPS
BID NO. 1213-29~ September 6,2012

OKLAHOMA FERGUSON OKC PIONEER SUPPLY | AMERICAN WATERWORKS HD SUPPLY
CONTRACTORS | WATER WORKS | WINWATER WORKS Moore, OK SUPPLY, INC. WATERWORKS
SUPPLY, INC. Oklahoma City, OK Oklshoma City, OK. MNorman, OK Cldshoma City, OK
Olklehoma City, OK
SECTION 34 109.00 100.42 79.09 NOBID 100.42 $7.00
6 X 15 INCH W 3/4"CC
SECTION 35 70.00 64.14 47.70 NO BID 64,13 72.00
6 X 8INCHW 1”CC
SECTION 36 128.00 100.42 79.09 NO BID 100.42 87.00
§X 15 INCH W 1"CC
SECTION 37 79.00 72.33 58.90 NO BID 72.32 89,00
& X 8 INCH W 3/4”CC
SECTION 38 129.00 132.64 99.45 NO BID 132.64 102.00
8 X 15 INCH W 3/4"CC
SECTION 39 79.00 72.33 58.50 NO BID 7232 89.00
8 X 8 INCHW 1"CC
SECTION 40 129.00 132.64 99.45 NO BID 132,64 102.00
§ X 15 INCHW 1'CC
SECTION 41 159.00 176.05 119.34 NO BID 176.05 147.00
12 X 35 INCH W 374"CC
SECTION 42 159.00 176.05 119.34 NO BID 176.05 147.00
12X 15SINCH W I"CC

RECOMMENDATION: That Bid No. 1213-29 for Meter Yokes, Repair Clamps, and Meler Boxes be awerded to American Waterworks Supply for Copper Meter Yokes
for Water Moeters; to American Waterworks Supply, Inc. for HDPE Meter Boxes with Cast Tron Lids; and as follows for Water Line Repair Clamps: to American
Waterworks Supply, Inc. for Section 2; to Oklehomna City Winwater Works for Sections 3,4, 5, 6,7,8,9, 10, 12, 14, 15, 16, 17, 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 27, 29, 30, 31,
32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 38, 39, 40, 41 and 42; to HD Supply Waterworks for Sections 11, 13, 26, and 28; and to Ferguson Water Works for Section 1 23 the best bidders
meeting all of the specifications. The repeir clamp contract is effective through September 30, 2013, or for an addltionsl one-year period up to four years, if agrecable by
the parties.

Forwarded by: David Hager, Line Maintenance Superintendent



