SECTION TWO - RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS - CLASS C BID #1516-46

ACTION SAFETY SUPPLY DIRECT TRAFFIC CONTROL ROADSAFE TRAFFIC SYSTEMS RUDY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Oktahoma City, OK Muskogee, OK Tulsa, OK Oklahoma City, OK
Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer Plastic Multi-Polymer
ITEM QUANTITY PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL | PRICE | TOTAL
Type 1 (EA) 400 $100.00]  $40,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 £0.00] NOBID $0.008 NOBID $0.00{ NO BID $0.00] NOBID £0.00| NOBID $0.00] NOBID
Type 2 (EA) 200 $100.00}  $20,000.00 50.00 50.00 $0.00) NOBID $0.000 NO BID $0.00] NO BID $0.00] NOBID $0.00| NO BID £0.00] NO BID
Type 1 Refurbished (EA) 200 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 NOBID $0.00 NO BID 50.00) NOBID $0.00] NO BID £0.00| NO BID $0.00] NO BID
Type 2 Aefurbishad (EA) 100 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00/ NOBID $0.00{ NOBID $0.00/ NO BID $0.00| NO BID $0.00| NG BID 50.00] NO BID
Lens Replacement Class C Type 1
{EA) 100 $15.00f  $1,500.00 $15.00f  $1,500.00 $0.00| NOBID $0.00] NO BID 50.00| NO BID $0.00] NOBID $0.00| NOBID $0.00] NO BID
Lens Replagement Class © Type 2
{EA) 100 515.00f  51,500.00 515.00] $1,500.00 £0.00] NOBID 50.00] NQBID $0.00] NOBID £0.00] NOBID $0.00| NO BID $0.00| NO BID
GRAND TOTAL $63,000,00 $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID NOQ BID | NO BID NO BID NO BID

Forwarded by: Dennis Davis, Trafiic Control Superviser




