TRAFFIC SIGNS AND ACCESSORIES

BID NO. 1213-27

pRogﬂglghc‘oap HALL SIGNS, INC| VULCAN SIGNS AM:S%?(Z%GN gﬁg;f,ﬁ?g MD SOLUTIONS | ROCAL, INC
{Jackson, MS}) (Bloomington, IN), {Foley, AL) (Greez:)orest. (Grand Prairie, TX) {Dublin, OH) {Frankfort, OH)
ITEM PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE
. SHEET ALUMINUM - 0.080 INCH PER SQUARE FODT $2.29 $2.73 $2.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Il SHEET ALUMINUM - 0.125 INGH PER SQUARE FOOT $4.90 $4.95 $3.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Il A. STREET NAME BRACKET SETS WITH 6 INGH BLADE
HOLDER $7.04 $8.34 $10.34 $10.50 $8.65 $7.99 NO BID
|l B. STREET NAME BRACKET SETS WITH 12 INCH BLADE
HOLDER $20.40 $19.00 $25.27 $26.00 $21.59 $21.95 NO BID
iif C. ADDITIONAL VANDAL PROOF BOLTS $0.29 $0.17 50.29 $0.22 50.30 $0.20 NO BID
Il D. ADDITIONAL VANDAL PROOF SCREWS $0.25 $0.17 $0.25 $0.22 $0.30 $0.20 NO BID
IILE. INSTALLATION TOOLS FOR VANDAL PROOF BOLTS $1.63 $1.47 $4.50 $3.14 $4.25 $6.00 NO BID
It F. INSTALLATION TOOLS FOR VANDAL PROOF SCREWS $1.63 $2.20 $4.50 $2.58 $8.20 $6.00 NO BID

1t is recommended that Bid No. 1213-27 be awarded as follows: CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORP: Sections IIL A and 11l F; HALL SIGNS, INC: Sections il B through [l E;

VULCAN SIGNS: Sections | and I1.

Forwarded by: Dennis W, Davis, Traffic Control Supervisor




